Consulaat-Generaal van het

Koninkrijk der Nederlanden

fax o
Via San Vitore, 45
20123 Milano

A Ass. Viafarini Da Consulsat-Generaal te Milaan

¢.a. Sig.ra Brusarosco Telefono +39.02.48558420

Telefax  +3902.48558452

ce mil@minbuza.nl

Telefax 0266804473

Data 18 novembre 2003

Numero  Incluso questa pagina 2

delle

Pagine

Oggetto  Sovvenzione Ter Heijne

Le anticipo il contratto,
Domani sard inviato via posta prioritaria.

Cordialmente, /(,@m

Margd Curto



m Consulaat-Generaal van het
Koninkrijk der Nederlanden

Spett.le
Associazione Viafarini Via San Vittore, 45
c.a. Sig.ra Patrizia Brusarosco 20123 Milano

Via Carlo Farini 35
20159 Milano

Data 18-11-2003 Autore M.Curto/O.Monti
Protocollo mc Telefono +39.02.48558420
Pagina 1/1 Telefax ~ +3902.48558452
Allegati 1 mil@minbuza.nl
Oggetto  Sovvenzione Consolato Generale Paesi Bassi/mostra

Ter Heijne
cc

Gentile Signora Brusarosco,

Come d'accordo Le invio I'allegato contratto.

La prego di restituire una copia firmata e di fornirei al piu presto le fatture, dopo di che
provvederemo a fare il bonifico presso il conto che Lei gentilmente vorra indicarci

(oppure attraverso assegno, se Lei preferisce).

La ringrazio per la cortese collaborazione.

Cordiali saluti,

Margo Curto



CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT

In reference to your letter of November 7" 2003 and your invitation to the Dutch artist, Mathilde ter
Heijne, I am pleased to inform you, on behalf of the Dutch Ministry of Foreign Affairs, that a
contribution not exceeding € 1.250 will be made available to the costs of the exhibition by Mathilde

ter Heijne that will be held in the Viafarini Gallery in Milan.
The contribution shall be subject to the following conditions:

1. The activity for which the contribution is provided shall be implemented:
- on your responsibility;
- in the manner described in the aforementioned letter;
- in the period from 26 February to 19 March 2004.

2. Any changes in the agreed manner of implementation shall be submitted to me in writing in
advance for approval. I shall respond in writing to the proposed changes within a month of
receiving notification. If no response is received within this period, the changes shall be
deemed to have been approved. Any agreements with third parties relating to the activity for
which the contribution is provided shall be recorded in writing.

3. The contribution shall be paid after receipt of this signed contribution agreement and after
receipt of any voucher from which the expenditure or part thereof appears.

4. You shall be responsible for maintaining sound management procedures and keeping proper
accounts in respect of the activity for which the contribution is provided.

=% Any changes and/or additions to this agreement shall be valid only if agreed in writing by
both parties. This agreement shall be governed by Dutch law. Any dispute arising from this
agreement shall be referred to the competent court in The Hague.

If you accept this offer, please sign and date both copies (or ensure that they are signed and dated) and

return one of them to the Dutch Consulate General in Milan marked for the attention of Mr. B.K.H.
Boersen , within 1 week of the date of this letter.

Milan, 19 November 2003
For the Netherlands Consulate General

AGREED

{) A M—/—’/\—_’——/

——————

B.K.H. Boersen Ms. Patrizia Brusarosco
Consul President of Associazione Viafarini

Please indicate below your preferred method of payment (check/ bank assignment):

AVT99/BZ55699



Mar, 13 gen 2004 13:43

Da: Pennink, Marion <marion.pennink@minbuza.nl>

A: 'Viafarini' <viafarini@viafarini.org>

Cc: "Gorcum, DA-van" <da-van.gorcum@minbuza.nl>, "Ernst, Bas"
<bas.ernst@minbuza.nl>

Data: Venerdi, 28 novembre 2003 10:14

Oggetto: RE: mathilde ter Heijne

Dear Ms Brusarosco,

In answer to your request for support of the Mathilde ter Heijne project, I
should like to ask you the following. We can agree to a contribution to the
project, for either the cost of the technical equipment, or for the
invitation cards/publicity, press, with an amount of EUR 2000. Can you
agree to thi?. 1If so, please let me know. We shall send you the subsidy
letter in January, next.

Yours sincerely,

Marion Pennink (please note spelling of my last name)

From: Viafarini [mailto:viafarini@viafarini.org]
Sent: Thursday, November 20, 2003 2:34 PM

To: Pennink, Marion

Subject: mathilde ter Heijne

AMBASCIATA DEI PAESI BASSI

Gentile signora Marion Penninkursal,

I follow our conversation in relation to Mathilde ter Heijne project for
Spazio Viafarini, in order to ask to the Embassy to contribute to the cost
for tecnical equipment (noleggio materiale video) instead of cost for
publication of catalogue, because it should already be covered.

Sincerely,

Patrizia Brusarosco

VIAFARINI

via Farini 35

I - 20159 Milano

tel / fax +39 0266804473
www.viafarini.org
viafarini@viafarini.org

Disclaimer Ministerie van Buitenlandse Zaken:

De informatie verzonden met dit e-mailbericht is uitsluitend bestemd voor de
geadresseerde. Gebruik door onbevoegden, openbaarmaking of vermenigvuldiging is
verboden. De afzender is niet aansprakelijk in geval van onjuiste overbrenging van
het e-mailbericht en/of bij ontijdige ontvangst daarvan.

Disclaimer Ministry of Foreign Affairs of the Netherlands:
The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to whom or which

Pagina 1 di 2
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Ambassade van het

Koninkrijk der Nederlanden

VIAFARINI
A.c.a. Patrizia Brusarosco
Via Farini 35 Via Michele Mercati, 8
20159 MILANO 00197 ROMA
Datum 30 Gennaio 2004 Autore: D.A. van Gorcum
prot.no. ocz/rom/mp/2004 Telefoon 06.3221141
Blad 1/3 Fax 06.3221440
E- da-van.gorcum(@minbuza.nl
mail
DISPOSIZIONE

L'Ambasciata del Regno dei Paesi Bassi,

CONSIDERATA

la domanda di sussidio dalla VIAFARINI con sede in Via Farini 35 a Milano in
seguito chiamato il “ Beneficiario del Sussidio”,

VISTA

la Legge Quadro relativa ai sussidii del Ministero degli Affari Esteri dei Paesi
Bassi;

DISPONE

di elargire la somma di € 2.000,00 a favore della pubblicita, gli inviti o per il
noleggio materiale video per la mostra di Matilde ter Heijne che si terra dal 26
Febbraio al 19 Marzo 2004 a Milano.

La somma di € 1.600,00 verra elargito, subito dopo l'invio di questa
disposizione e non appena questa Ambasciata riceve i dati bancari della
VIAFARINI. La rimanente somma di € 400,00 sara versato dopo aver ricevuto
al termine della mostra il resoconto finanziaro e una relazione artistica.

Nei libri contabili dell’ Ambasciata del Regno dei Paesi Bassi a Roma, il
sussidio di cui si tratta ¢ registrato sotto il numero PCAP/BK-04/2004.

L’elargizione del sopraccitato sussidio € vincolato dalle seguenti clausole:



2.1.3

Kenmerk
Blad

2.

Ambassade van het
Koninkrijk der Nederlanden

le attivita che verranno realizzate grazie al sussidio elargito saranno svolte

sotto la responsabilita del "beneficiario del sussidio"e nel modo in cui esse

sono state descritte nella domanda inoltrata ed in conformita del preventivo
allegato alla domanda

L’ Ambasciata del Regno dei Paesi Bassi dovra essere citata in tutte le
pubblicazioni e la pubblicita della mostra;

11 “Benificiario del sussidio” terra informato I'Ambasciata di ogni eventuale
modifica o integrazione dei dati in base ai quali il sussidio viene elargito e
non apportera alcuna modifica senza previa autorizzazione dell'Ambasciata;

11 “Beneficiario del sussidio” inviera all'Ambasciata entro due mesi dal
termine delle attivita un resoconto finale contentente una valutazione del
progetto (tra cui I resultuati raggiunti, eventuali articoli comparsi sulla
stampa, numero dei visitatori ecc.ecc.);

Dopo che il resoconto (vedi articolo 4) sara stato approvato, I’ammontare
del sussidio verra fissato definitivamente ed un eventuaie ricalcolo della
somma si svolgera entro 30 giorni;

L'Ambasciata si riserva il diritto di diminuire I’ammontare del
finanziamento del progetto, di bloccarlo prima del tempo oppure di esigere
il rimborso parziale o totale delle somme gia versate, qualora il
“Benificiario del sussidio” non osservi o sia in ritardo riguardo agli obblighi
che gli derivano dalla presente disposizione;

11 “Beneficiario del sussidio” dovra avere cura della gestione appropriata e
dell’amministrazione delle attivita a favore delle quali il sussidio viene
COoncesso.

'/1 O oS

M.
Co

nsigliere per gli Affari Culturali

N.B.  La presente disposizione ¢ stata rilasciata a nome e per conto del Ministro degli Affari

2/3

Esteri dei Paesi Bassi. Il ricorso scritto potra essere inoltrato entro sei settimane dalla
notifica della disposizione all’indirizzo dell’Ambasciatore R.H. Loudon, Ambasciata
del Regno dei Paesi Bassi, Via Michele Mercati 8, 00197 Roma.
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Ambassade van het
Koninkrijk der Nederlanden

VIAFARINI

A.c.a. Patrizia Brusarosco

Via Farini 35 Ambasciata dei Paesi Bassi
20159 MILANO Via Michele Merecati, 8

00197 ROMA

Data 22 dicembre 2004 Autore  D.A. van Gorcum
Protocollo ocz/rom/dvg/2004 Telefono  06.3221141
Pagina 1/1 Telefax  06.321.07.67
Allegati da-van.gorcum@minbuza.nl
Oggetto  sussidio progetto PCAP/BK-04/2004

cec

Gentile signora Brusarosco

In seguito alla relazione artistica, il resoconto finanziario ed altro materiale della
mostra di Mathilde Heijne nella Galleria Viafarini a Milano, mi pregio informarLe che
ho fissato definitivamente 'ammontare del sussidio alla somma di € 2000,--

Il restante di € 400,-- ¢ gia stata versata sul conto intestato all'Associazione Viafarini
presso la Banca Intesa BCI.

Con i miei migliori auguri di buone feste

o ——

— Q
| N
-/ L/") ) e

Marion Pennink-,?ljs@ling
Consigliere per gli Affari Culturali

N.B.  La presente disposizione ¢ stata rilasciata a nome e per conto del Ministro degli Affari
Esteri dei Paesi Bassi. Il ricorso scritto potra essere inoltrato entro sei settimane dalla
notifica della disposizione all’indirizzo dell’ Ambasciatore R.H. Loudon, Ambasciata
del Regno dei Paesi Bassi, Via Michele Mercati 8, 00197 Roma. Il ricorso scritto
dovra essere firmato e contenere almeno: il nome e 1’ indirizzo del ricorrente, la data
di notifica, la descrizione o la copia della disposizione contro cui si ricorre ¢ le
motivazioni sulle quali il ricorso si basa.



dd & nr

September 25, 2003, INT BKPR 03-244 UIT03-03648-0
onderwerp

Mathilde ter Heijne
19 February 2004 / 19 March 2004

Fondazione Viafarini
Mrs P. Brusarosco
via Carlo Farini 35
20159 MILAAN
Italie

S

Mondriaan Stichting

(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56 Thank you for your letter of September 17, 2003, with your application for financial support of
Mathilde ter Heijne.

Dear Mrs Brusarosco,

1071 KN Amsterdam

tel +31(0)20 676 20 32 You will be notified of our decision within at latest three months. This period is required for
fax +31(0)20 676 20 36 expert assessment. We would appreciate you informing the involved artist of this procedure.

Fortis Bank 83.67.63.092
Taco de Neef is handling your application.

With kind regards,

" (Gitta Luiten
director



S

Mondriaan Stichting
(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56
1071 KN Amsterdam

tel +31(0)20 676 20 32

fax +31(0)20 676 20 36
Fortis Bank 83.67.63.092

DA
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dd &nr

November 24, 2003, INT BKPR 03-244 UIT03-04088-t
onderwerp

Decision application financial support Mathilde ter Heijne
February 19, 2004 / March 19, 2004

Enclosures: 2

Fondazione Viafarini
Ms P. Brusarosco
via Carlo Farini 35
20159 MILAAN
Italié

Dear Ms Brusarosco,

As we announced in our letter of September 25, 2003, we are now in a position to notify you of
our decision about your application for financial support of Mathilde ter Heijne.

Our external experts have reviewed your application. We have ascertained that their assessment
is conscientious and complies with the guidelines of our grant program for the presentation of
Dutch visual art and design outside the Netherlands. Our decision is based on the following
considerations.

In 2001 the Mondriaan Foundation supported a combined presentation of Dutch contemporary
art and design at your institute. At that occasion we expressed our appreciation of your activities
program. We still hold that positive opinion. We feel that Viafarini is a good location for this

-, presentation by Mathilde ter Heijne. This project will contribute to her international position.

For these reasons, we are pleased to support your presentation. We contribute a maximum of

€ 7.050, covering travel, subsistence (per diem up to € 45 per day), transport, insurance, rental
of equipment (up to 50% of the rental costs with a maximum of € 2.500) and part of the
publication (up to 50% of the publication costs, with a maximum of € 1.250). If you require an
advance payment, please apply to us in writing. We can transfer an amount of up to € 3.500.
The remaining part of our contribution will be transferred after approval of your final project
report. Please note that the final height of support will be based on the actual, realised costs for
the mentioned budget headings only. The enclosed terms are contingent to our support. You are
required to submit your final project report before June 30, 2004.

Our grant is made available from the Netherlands Culture fund of the Dutch Ministries for
Foreign Affairs and Education, Culture and Science.

Your documentation will be returned by separate post.
We hope your presentation will prove to be a success. \ \
J

With kind regards,
MONDRIAAN FOUNDATION N®)

(. O.

Gitta Luiten
director




S

Mondriaan Stichting
(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56
1071 KN Amsterdam
t+31(0)20 6762032
f+31(0)20 6762036
info@/www.
mondriaanfoundation.nl
Fortis bank 83.67.63.092

dd &nr

February 11, 2004, INT BKPR 03-244 UIT04-00506-t
onderwerp

Mathilde ter Heijne
februari 19, 2004 / maart 19, 2004

Fondazione Viafarini
Attn Mrs P. Brusarosco
via Carlo Farini 35
20159 MILAAN

Italie

Dear Mrs Brusarosco,

Thank you for your letter of February 4, 2004, requesting an advance payment of our grant for
the exhibition Mathilde ter Heijne.

An advance payment of € 3.500 will be transferred to your Intesa BCI, Milano account number
70273230106 (BIC: BCITIT22; routing 03069/09461) in the name of Associazione Viafarini,
with as reference advance payment BKPR 03-244. The remaining part of our contribution will
be transferred after approval of your final project report, which must be submitted within three
months after termination of the project.

We can agree to your proposal to rent additional projectors from another gallery and monitors
from Kunstverein Hannover and include these costs in vour report, as long as those costs are
reasonable.

With kind regards,
MONDRIAAN-FOUNDA

Gitta Lu
director



S

Mondriaan Stichting
(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56
1071 KN Amsterdam

tel +31(0)20 676 20 32

fax +31(0)20 676 20 36
Fortis Bank 83.67.63.092

dd & nr

ENCLOSURE onderwerp

MONDRIAAN FOUNDATION GRANT TERMS FOR FINANCIAL SUPPORT OF AN
EXHIBITION

a) The project must be realized as outlined in your request.
b) The financial support must be used for this specific project only.

¢) You are requested to send both the Mondriaan Foundation and the Dutch Ministry of
Culture a timely invitation to the opening ceremony of the presentation. The full
address of the Ministry of Culture is Ministry of Education, Culture and Science,
Visual Arts Department, PO Box 25000, 2700 LZ Zoetermeer, the Netherlands.

d) At latest three months after termination of the project you must send us a report of the
project (including press reviews, visual documentation, number of visitors and
eventual follow-up of the exhibition), together with two catalogues or brochures (if
published).

e) At the same time, you must send us a specified financial account of the project,
indicating all expenses and revenues (including entrance fees, sales of catalogues and
number of visitors) with copies of relevant bills. This account should be comparable

with the budget you sent us with the request.

f) In your external communications on this project (press, catalogue, correspondence)

| we request you to mention that the project was realized with financial support of the

Mondriaan Foundation, Amsterdam, if possible using our logo. The logo can be
obtained from the public relations officer of the Mondriaan Foundation, who can also
inform you about its correct presentation. In case of lack of space, it will suffice to
mention Mendriaan Foundation, Amsterdam. Since our grant is made available from the
Netherlands Culture fund of the Dutch Ministries for Foreign Affairs and Education,
Culture and Science, we shall appreciate that you also mention this in your publicity and
external correspondence on the project.

Amsterdam, November 24, 2003



dd & nr

September 25, 2003, INT BKPR 03-244 UIT03-03648-0
onderwerp

Mathilde ter Heijne
19 February 2004 / 19 March 2004

Fondazione Viafarini
Mrs P. Brusarosco
via Carlo Farini 35
20159 MILAAN

Italié
Mondriaan Stichting Dear Mrs Brusarosco,
(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56 Thank you for your letter of September 17, 2003, with your application for financial support of
1071 KN Amsterdam Mathilde ter Heijne.
tel +31(0)20 676 20 32 You will be notified of our decision within at latest three months. This period is required for
fax +31(0)20 676 20 36 expert assessment. We would appreciate you informing the involved artist of this procedure.

Fortis Bank 83.67.63.092 )
Taco de Neef is handling your application.

With kind regards,

Gitta Luiten
director



S

Mondriaan Stichting
(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56
1071 KN Amsterdam
t+31(0)20 6762032
f+31(0)20 6762036
info@/www.
mondriaanfoundation.nl
Fortis bank 83.67.63.092

dd &nr

July 2, 2004, INT BKPR 03-244 UIT04-02572-d
onderwerp

Additional invoice Mathilde ter Heijne

Associazione Viafarini
Ms P. Brusarosco

via Carlo Farini 35
20159 MILAAN

Italié

Dear Ms Brusarosco,

Thank you for your fax of June 17, with an additional invoice for the presentation by Mathilde
ter Heijne.

Unfortunately we cannot grant your request to cover a part of these additional costs. In our
confirmation letter of November 24, 2003 we wrote that we would cover up to € 2.500 rental
of equipment. Based on your report of April 22, we included this maximum amount in our
definite grant. Unfortunately it is not possible to heighten our support for the rental costs at this
stage.

With kir‘Gré‘ ards;
MONDRIAAN FOUNDATION

g, @

director




/ dd &nr

1 June 11, 2004, INT BKPR 03-244 UIT04-02198-e
onderwerp

Report
Mathilde ter Heijne

Associazione Viafarini
Ms P. Brusarosco

via Carlo Farini 35
20159 MILAAN

Italie
Mondriaan Stichting Dear Ms Brusaroses,
(Mondriaan Foundation)
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56 Thank you for the report of the presentation by Mathilde ter Heijne, which we received on April S
1071 KN Amsterdam 22, 2008,
t+31(0)20 6762032 We accept your financial statement and set our definite grant at € 6.003, for travel of Mathilde
f+31(0)20 6762036 ter Heijne, subsidence, transport and part of the installation and publication. We will remit an
info@/www. amount of € 2.503 to Intesa BCI, Milaan, 70273230106 (BIC: BCITIT22, Routing:

3 : 03069/09461), with as reference: BKFR 03-244.
mondriaanfoundation.nl

Fortis bank 83.67.63.092 We wish you and your colleagues success with your future activities.

With kind regards,

Gitta Luiten
director



FARINI

via Farini 35 20159 Milano Associazione per [ promozione
della ricerca artistica

Tel 02 66804473 / 69001524

Fax 02 66804473

e-mail viafarini@viafarini.org

www.viafarini.org

Mr Taco de Neef
Mondriaan Foundation
Jacob Obrechtstraat 56

1071 KN Amsterdam

Milan, 17 June 2004
Dear Mr Taco de Neef,

please find enclosed the missing invoice for Mathilde ter Heijne exhibition that we didn’t
include at the time we made the calculations.

Please let us know if it is possible to add this cost to our final report.

Thank you in advance for your etfort.

Also please find enclosed the Flash Art review.

y m rely,

atl 1zia Brusaxosco



Calculation

INCOME
Mondriaan Foundation Euro 7.050,-
Royal Netherlands Embassy, Rome Euro 2.000,-
Royal Netherlands Consulate, Milano Euro 1.250,-
Euro 10.300,-
EXPENSES
1 ticket director Brusarosco to Berlin Euro 148,00
1 ticket ter Heijne Berlino-Milano-Berlino Euro 195,68
Total Travels Euro 343,68
apartment Euro 800,-
per diem 5 days x 45 Euro 225.-
Total Subsistence Euro 1.025,00
Amsterdam-Milano Euro 228,00-
Berlino-Milano Euro 288,00,-

Milano Hannover Euro 288.00.-
Milano-Berlino Euro 228.,00.-

Total Trasport Euro 1.032,00

Renting DVD players
Renting videoprojectors/amplifiers/DVD
1 DVD player

Euro 1.800,00
Euro 1.800,00

Mihovil Markulin installation E”'ﬁo :30968000
installing materials (ferramenta) E“Lg 7;) 20’
wood panel "
Total Installing/ Tecnical equipment Eumo 142(9)508020
uro 4.938,
text Gabi Scardi Euro 1.250.00
trgns!anon Euro 200.00.-
printing o Euro 1.056,00
Total Publication Euro 2.506.00
Monica Thurner Euro 1.988,26
Bolli spedizioni Euro 450,00
Total Comunication/Promotion Euro 2.438,26

Mondriaan Foundation contributed to: Travels, Subsistence, Trasport, 50% Installing Tecnical equipment,
50% Publication

Royal Netherlands Embassy contributed to: Comunication Promotion

Royal Netherlands Consulate contributed to: 50% Pubblication




FARINI

via Farini 35 20159 Milano Associazione per la promozione
Tel 02 66804473 / 69001524 della ricerca artistica

Fax 02 66804473

e-mail viafarini@viafarini.org

www.viafarini.org

Spett.le Comune di Milano - Settore Musei e Mostre

Alla cortese attenzione dell’assessore dott. Salvatore Carrubba

Milano, 12 gennaio 2004

Oggetto: Richiesta di patrocinio per la mostre:

Claudia Losi

Balena Physalus
a cura di Alessandra Pioselli e Gabi Scardi

Periodo mostra: 5 febbraio - 20 febbraio 2004

Mathilde ter Heijne

Qo akti?

a cura di Gabi Scardi

Periodo mostra: 26 febbraio - 19 marzo 2004

Con la presente si richiede il patrocinio del Comune di Milano - Settore Musei e Mostre alle
mostre personali presso lo spazio Viafarini degli artisti Claudia Losi (5-20 febbraio 2004) e
Mathilde ter Heijne (26febbraio-19 marzo 2004). Si allegano informazioni.

L’obiettivo € di inserire queste iniziative come proseguimento del programma realizzato con
la Vostra collaborazione.

Distinti saluti.
Per Associazione Viafarini

Il Presidente

Patrizia Brusarosco
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Sattore Musei e Mostre
il Direttore

Milano |

@

Comune
di Milano

2 9 GFN 2004

Gent.ma Dr.ssa

PATRIZIA BRUSAROSCO
Presidente

Associazione Viafarini

Via G. Giusti, 16

20158 MILANO

XN.0 04473

Gentile Dottoressa,

ho il piacere di comunicarLe che |a Giunta Comunale nella seduta del
27 1.2004 ha concesso il patrocinio comunale alle mostre dal titolo “Balena Physalus” dell'artista
Claudia Losi e “Qo Akti?" dell'artista Mathilde Ter Heijne da Voi organizzate e che si terranno
presso la Vostra sede rispettivamente dal 5 al 20 febbraio 2004 e dal 26 febbraio al 19 marzo
2004. .

Pertanto sul materiale promozionale della manifestazione, oltre al logo del Comune di
Milano, dovra comparire la dicitura “con il patrocinio del Comune di Milano — Cultura e Musei -
Seftore Musei e Mostre”.

Augurando all'iniziativa il miglior esito colgo I'occasione per porgere cordiali safuti.

iL WETTORE

Prot. Gen.:45303/04
mf



